
fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk lfpoky; 
 

vf/klwpuk 
 

fnukad  09 flrEcj] 2020 
 
 la[;k fo0l0&fo/kk;u&fo/ks;d@1&10@2020-&fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk dh izfØ;k ,oa dk;Z 
lapkyu fu;ekoyh] 1973 ds fu;e 140 ds vUrxZr vkS|ksfxd fookn ¼fgekpy izns'k la'kks/ku½ fo/ks;d] 
2020 ¼2020 dk fo/ks;d la[;kad 5½ tks vkt fnukad 09 flrEcj] 2020 dks fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk esa 
iqj%LFkkfir gks pqdk gS] loZlk/kkj.k dh lwpukFkZ jkti= esa eqfnzr djus gsrq izsf"kr fd;k tkrk gSA 

 
gLrk{kfjr@& 

lfpo] 
fg0 iz0 fo/kku lHkkA 

 
&&&&&&&&&& 

 
2020 dk fo/ks;d la[;kad 5 

 
vkS|ksfxd fookn ¼fgekpy izns'k la'kks/ku½ fo/ks;d] 2020 

 
[k.Mksa dk Øe 

 
[k.M % 
 1- laf{kIr uke vkSj izkjEHkA 
 2- /kkjk 22 dk la”kks/kuA 
 3- /kkjk 25p dk la”kks/kuA 
 4- /kkjk 25V dk la”kks/kuA 
 5- 2020 ds fgekpy izns”k v/;kns”k la[;kad 4 dk fujlu vkSj O;ko`fRr;k¡A 
 

&&&&&&&&&  
 

2020 dk fo/ks;d la[;kad  5 
 

vkS|ksfxd fookn ¼fgekpy izns'k la'kks/ku½ fo/ks;d] 2020 
 

¼fo/kku lHkk esa iqj%LFkkfir :i esa½ 
 
 fgekpy izns”k jkT; dks ;Fkk ykxw vkS|ksfxd fookn vf/kfu;e] 1947 ¼1947 dk vf/kfu;e la[;kad 
14½ dk la”kks/ku djus ds fy, fo/ks;dA 
 
 Hkkjr x.kjkT; ds bdgRrjosa o"kZ esa fgekpy izns”k fo/kku lHkk }kjk fuEufyf[kr :i esa ;g 
vf/kfu;fer gks %&& 
 
 1- laf{kIr uke vkSj izkjEHk-&&¼1½  bl vf/kfu;e dk laf{kIr uke  vkS|ksfxd fookn ¼fgekpy 
izns”k la”kks/ku½ vf/kfu;e] 2020 gSA 
 
 ¼2½  ;g 9 tqykbZ] 2020 ls izo`Ùk gqvk le>k tk,xkA 
 



 2- /kkjk 22 dk Lak”kks/ku-&&fgekpy izns'k jkT; dks ;Fkk ykxw vkS|ksfxd fookn vf/kfu;e] 1947 
¼1947 dk 14½ ¼ftls blesa blds i'pkr~ ßewy vf/kfu;eß dgk x;k gS½ dh /kkjk 22 dh mi/kkjk ¼1½ vkSj 
¼2½ esa] ßyksd mi;ksxh lsokß “kCnksa ds i”pkr~ ßvkSj xSj&yksd mi;ksxh lsokß “kCn vUr%LFkkfir fd, tk,axsA 
 
 3- /kkjk 25p dk Lak”kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 25p ds [k.M ¼[k½ esa] ^^ianzg fnuß 'kCnksa ds 
LFkku ij ^^lkB fnu** “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 4- /kkjk 25V dk Lak”kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 25V dh mi/kkjk ¼1½ esa] **,d lkS** 'kCnksa ds 
LFkku ij **nks lkS** 'kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 5- 2020 ds fgekpy izns'k v/;kns'k la[;kad 4 dk fujlu vkSj O;ko`fRr;ka-&&¼1½ vkS|ksfxd 
fookn ¼fgekpy izns'k la'kks/ku½ v/;kns”k] 2020 dk ,rn~}kjk fujlu fd;k tkrk gSSA 
 
 ¼2½  ,sls fujlu ds gksrs gq, Hkh bl izdkj fujflr v/;kns'k ds v/khu  dh xbZ dksbZ ckr ;k 
dkjZokbZ bl  vf/kfu;e ds rRLFkkuh mica/kksa ds v/khu fof/kekU; :i esa dh xbZ le>h tk,xhA 
 

&&&&&&&  
 

mn~~ns';ksa vkSj dkj.kksa dk dFku 
 
 vkfFkZd mnkjhdj.k ds ;qx esa] vkS|ksfxd fookn vf/kfu;e] 1947 ¼1947 dk 14½] tks ,d dsUnzh; 
fo/kku gS] ds dqN mica/k vizpfyr gks x, gSa D;ksafd bu mica/kksa dks fiNys dbZ o’kks± ls la'kksfèkr ughas 
fd;k x;k gSA ;g ik;k x;k gS fd vkS|ksfxd fookn vf/kfu;e] 1947  ds vizpfyr mica/k jkT; esa 
izkbosV fofu/kku dks vkÑ’V djus esa ck/kd gSa vkSj jkT; esa dkjckj djus dh lqxerk dks Hkh ckf/kr dj 
jgs gSaA fgekpy izns'k jkT; esa vkS|ksfxd fofu/kku] mRiknu vkSj jkstxkj ds voljksa esa o`f) djus rFkk 
dkjckj djus dh lqxerk esa vkSj o`f) djus rFkk Je fof/k;ksa ds izorZu esa ikjnf'kZrk lqfuf'pr djus gsrq 
iwoksZDr vf/kfu;e esa dqN la'kks/ku fd, tkus vko';d gks x, gSaA Hkkjr ljdkj }kjk izkjEHk fd, x, **esd 
bu bf.M;k** dk;ZØe ds vuqlkj ns'k esa **dkjckj djus dh lqxerk** Hkh vfuok;Zrkvksa esa ls ,d gSA 
blfy,] vkS|ksfxd LFkkiuksa  ds lkFk&lkFk deZdkjksa dks ,d lgk;d vkSj dkjckj vuqdwy okrkoj.k iznku 
djus ds fy,] vkS|ksfxd fookn vfèkfu;e] 1947 ¼1947 dk 14½ ds dqN micU/kksa dks la'kksf/kr djuk 
vko';d gks x;k gSA 
 
 fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk l= esa ugha Fkh vkSj fgekpy izns'k jkT; dks ;Fkk ykxw vkS|ksfxd 
fookn vf/kfu;e] 1947 esa la'kks/ku djuk vfuok;Z gks x;k FkkA blfy, fgekpy izns'k ds jkT;iky }kjk] 
Hkkjr ds jk’Vªªifr ds vuqns'kksa dks vfHkizkIr djus ds i'pkr~] Hkkjr ds lafoèkku ds vuqPNsn 213 ds [k.M 
¼1½ ds v/khu iznRr 'kfDr;ksa dk iz;ksx djrs gq,] vkS|ksfxd fookn ¼fgekpy iznss'k la'kks/ku½ v/;kns'k] 
2020 ¼2020 dk v/;kns”k la[;kad 4½ rkjh[k 7 tqykbZ] 2020 dks iz[;kfir fd;k x;k Fkk ftls jkti= 
¼bZ&xt+V½] fgekpy izns'k esa rkjh[k 9 tqykbZ] 2020 dks izdkf'kr fd;k x;k FkkA vc] mDr v/;kns'k dks 
fcuk fdlh mikUrj.k ds  fu;fer fo/kku }kjk izfrLFkkfir fd;k tk jgk gSA  
 
 ;g fo/ks;d mi;qZDr mn~~ns';ksa dh iwfrZ ds fy, gSA 
 

          ¼fcØe flag½ 
izHkkjh eU=hA 

 
f”keyk %   
rkjh[k % -----------------------------] 2020 
 

&&&&&&&& 



 
AUTHORITATIVE  ENGLISH  TEXT 

 
Bill No. 5  of  2020 

 
THE  INDUSTRIAL  DISPUTES  (HIMACHAL  PRADESH  AMENDMENT) 

BILL,  2020 
 

ARRANGEMENT  OF  CLAUSES 
 

Clauses : 
 
 1.  Short title and commencement.  
 2.  Amendment of section 22. 
 3.  Amendment of section 25F. 
 4.  Amendment of section 25K. 
 5.  Repeal of the Himachal Pradesh Ordinance No. 4 of 2020 and savings. 
 

________  
 

Bill No. 5 of  2020 
 

THE  INDUSTRIAL  DISPUTES  (HIMACHAL  PRADESH  AMENDMENT)  
BILL,  2020 

 
(AS  INTRODUCED  IN  THE  LEGISLATIVE  ASSEMBLY) 

 
A 
 

BILL 
 
 to amend the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (Act No. 14 of 1947) in its application to the 
State of Himachal Pradesh. 
 
 BE it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of Himachal Pradesh in the Seventy-first Year of 
the Republic of India as follows :— 
 
 1. Short title and commencement.—(1) This Act may be called the Industrial Disputes 
(Himachal Pradesh Amendment) Act, 2020. 
 
 (2)  It shall be deemed to have come into force on 9th day of July, 2020. 
 
 2. Amendment of section 22.—In section 22 of the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (14 of 
1947) in its application to the State of Himachal Pradesh (hereinafter referred to as the “principal 
Act”), in sub-sections (1) and (2),  after the words “public utility service”, the words “and non-
public utility service” shall be inserted. 
 
 3. Amendment of section 25F.—In section 25F of the principal Act, in clause (b), for 
the words “fifteen days”, the words “sixty days” shall be substituted. 
 
 4. Amendment of section 25K.— In section 25K of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), 
for the words “one hundred”, the words “two hundred” shall be substituted. 



 
 5. Repeal of the Himachal Pradesh Ordinance No. 4 of 2020 and savings.—(1) The 
Industrial Disputes (Himachal Pradesh Amendment) Ordinance, 2020 is hereby repealed. 
 
 (2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken under the Ordinance so 
repealed, shall be deemed to have been validly done or taken under the corresponding provisions of 
this Act. 
 

_________  
 

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS 
 
 In the era of economic liberalisation, some of the provisions of the Industrial Disputes Act, 
1947 (Act No. 14 of 1947) which is a Central legislation, have become outdated because these 
provisions have not been amended for the last so many years. It has been found that the outdated 
provisions of the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947  are impediment in attracting the private investment 
and are also hampering the ease of doing business in the State. In order to increase industrial 
investment, production and employment opportunities and further enhancement of ease of doing 
business in the State of Himachal Pradesh and to ensure transparency in enforcement of the Labour 
Laws, some amendments are necessary in the aforesaid Act. As per “Make in India” programme 
launched by the Government of India, one of the requirements is “Ease of doing business” in the 
Country. Therefore, to provide a conducive and business friendly environment to the Industrial 
establishments as well as to the workmen, there is an urgent need to amend some provisions of the 
Industrial Disputes Act, 1947. 
 
 Since, the Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly was not in session and the amendments 
in the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947  in its application to the State of Himachal Pradesh had to be 
made urgently, therefore, the Governor of Himachal Pradesh, after obtaining the instructions from 
the President of India, in exercise of the powers conferred under clause (1) of article 213 of the 
Constitution of India, promulgated the Industrial Disputes (Himachal Pradesh Amendment) 
Ordinance, 2020 (Ordinance No. 4 of 2020) on 7th July, 2020 which was published in the Rajpatra 
(e-Gazette), Himachal Pradesh on 9th July, 2020. Now, the said Ordinance is being replaced by a 
regular Legislation without any modification. 
 
 This Bill seeks to achieve the aforesaid objectives.  
 

                                                 (BIKRAM SINGH) 
                    Minister-in-Charge. 

SHIMLA : 
THE …………….…., 2020 


